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Check Reply

Reviewer's Name Please - [JAB-22-0155
Kotak Masuk

Dr. Arshad Javaid <arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk>

Sen, 11 Apr
22.33

kepada saya

Dear Author

I am the handling editor of your paper IJAB-22-0155. Kindly send

me names (also position, official address and official emails, phone, research
area) of three reviewers (PhDs only) who can rapidly review your paper in two
weeks.

Regards

Dr. Arshad Javaid

Associate Professor

Department of Plant Pathology

Faculty of Agricultural Sciences

University of the Punjab, Quaid-i-Azam Campus
Lahore, Pakistan

Phone: +92-42-99231846

Cell: +92-300-4580679

Sel, 12 Apr

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com> 20.58

kepada Arshad

Dear Dr. Arshad Javaid
The names of our reviewers are included in the



attachment to this letter.

Thank you for your attention and help
regards

IK Widnyana

Dr. Arshad Javaid <arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk>

Sel, 24 Mei
02.32

kepada saya

Dear Author

I have sent your manuscript to your suggested reviewers.
Kindly ask them to submit the review report in 1 to 2
weeks so that paper can be finalized. Kindly also ask them
to check their Spam folder if they do not find review
request in their inbox.

Regards

Dr. Arshad Javaid

Professor

Department of Plant Pathology

Faculty of Agricultural Sciences

University of the Punjab, Quaid-i-Azam Campus
Lahore, Pakistan

Phone: +92-42-99231846

Cell: +92-300-4580679



Sel, 24 Mei

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com> 07.35

kepada Arshad

Dear Professor Dr. Arshad Javaid

We will immediately follow up on your suggestions, thank you for your attention

Regards

Widnyana, IK

Dr. Arshad Javaid <arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk>

Min, 5 Jun
11.20

kepada saya

Terjemahkan pesan

No need for any other review report as we have reports of
two reviewers that is enough.

Dr. Arshad Javaid

Professor

Department of Plant Pathology

Faculty of Agricultural Sciences

University of the Punjab, Quaid-i-Azam Campus
Lahore, Pakistan

Phone: +92-42-99231846

Cell: +92-300-4580679



Fwd: Review Report - [JAB-22-0155

Kotak Masuk

Dr. Arshad Javaid <arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk>

Kam, 14 Jul
23.51

kepada saya

Terjemahkan pesan

On June 2, 2022 I sent you the Review report. I am
forwarding the same again.

Dear Author

1- Please find attached comments on your paper submitted to the
International Journal of Agriculture and Biology. Your paper needs Major
Revision.

2- Make any further correction using track change system (in editor’s
comments copy) otherwise the revision will not be entertained. Also
incorporate Reviewer’s suggestions in this file.

3- You can accept the changes which I made in Track Change System

BUT do not delete the comments.

4- Also provide a Response Letter to give your response to every comment
given in the annotated manuscript.

5- Revise paper in accordance with the attached sample paper.

6- Submit Revised paper along with a language correction/editing
certificate in 7 days. Delay in submission of revision or incomplete revision
may result in rejection of your paper.

Kind regards

Dr. Arshad Javaid

Professor

Department of Plant Pathology



Faculty of Agricultural Sciences

University of the Punjab, Quaid-i-Azam Campus
Lahore, Pakistan

Phone: +92-42-99231846

Cell: +92-300-4580679

Editor MYCOPATH  hitp://111.68.103 26/journals/index.php/mycopath

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Dr. Arshad Javaid <arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk>
Date: Thu, 2 Jun 2022 at 01:58

Subject: Review Report - IJAB-22-0155
To: | Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com>

Dear Author

1- Please find attached comments on your paper submitted to the
International Journal of Agriculture and Biology. Your paper needs Major
Revision.

2- Make any further correction using track change system (in editor’s
comments copy) otherwise the revision will not be entertained. Also
incorporate Reviewer’s suggestions in this file.

3- You can accept the changes which I made in Track Change System

BUT do not delete the comments.

4- Also provide a Response Letter to give your response to every comment
given in the annotated manuscript.

5- Revise paper in accordance with the attached sample paper.

6- Submit Revised paper along with a language correction/editing
certificate in 7 days. Delay in submission of revision or incomplete revision
may result in rejection of your paper.

Kind regards

Dr. Arshad Javaid

Professor

Department of Plant Pathology

Faculty of Agricultural Sciences

University of the Punjab, Quaid-i-Azam Campus
Lahore, Pakistan

Phone: +92-42-99231846

Cell: +92-300-4580679


http://111.68.103.26/journals/index.php/mycopath
mailto:arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk
mailto:widnyanaketut@gmail.com

Fw: Acceptance your paper for IJAB (M.S. #

IJAB-22-0155)
Kotak Masuk

Editorial Office ljab <editorijab@yahoo.com>

Kam, 28 Jul
12.29

kepada saya

Terjemahkan pesan
M.S. NO: IJAB-22-0155
M.S. Title: Potential Inhibitory Effects of Rhizopus oligosporus on the Growth

of Aspergillus flavus FNCC6109 in Corn Seeds
Accepted for: International Journal of Agriculture and Biology

| am pleased to inform you that your above referred paper has been finally accepted for
publication by the Editorial Office. You are, therefore, advised to deposit US$ 200.00 or
an equivalent amount in Euro as the publication charges of your accepted paper
through any of the following means:

To Friends Science Publishers through International Bank Account Number
(IBAN) PK47THABB0001427901881203 (Swift Code: HABBPKKA) Habib Bank of
Pakistan, University of Agriculture Branch, Faisalabad, Pakistan. Please Send a
copy of the transaction document indicating complete name and address of sender and
reference number of the accepted paper for which publication charges have been paid

at zafaruaf1@gmail.com and editorijab@yahoo.com

Account title: Friends Science Publishers
Account NO: (IBAN) PK47HABB0001427901881203

Swift Code: HABBPKKA


mailto:zafaruaf1@gmail.com
mailto:editorijab@yahoo.com

Address: Habib Bank of Pakistan, Bankers Street, Near Power House
Department, University of Agriculture Faisalabad, Pakistan

IJAB Office Address: House No 519, Umar Block, Riazul Jannah, Masjid Ismail
Road, Faisalabad, Pakistan

Galley of your manuscript will be sent to you within 20 days after receiving the
publication charges. After correction of the galley proof, final version of the paper can be
downloaded (free of cost) from www.fspublishers.org as soon as an issue of the journal
is uploaded on the website (normally, it takes 5-6 months). Hard copies of reprints or
journal issue will NOT be supplied.

Congratulations again on acceptance of your manuscript.
Regards,

Friends Science Publishers

Regards,

Office Assistant/Business Manager

Editorial Office

International Journal of Agriculture and Biology
Friends Science Publishers

Muhammad Farooq

Editor-in-Chief

International Journal of Agriculture and Biology
Friends Science Publishers



http://www.fspublishers.org/
http://www.fspublishers.org/
http://www.fspublishers.org/

Kam, 28 Jul

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com> 19.49

kepada Editorial

Dear
Thank you for the encouraging information. We will
immediately pay the publication fee.

Regards.
IK Widnyana

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com>

Kam, 28 Jul
20.02

kepada Editorial

Dear

We are asking for information. Is it permissible for us to
pay via Paypal?

We are waiting for the information, and thank you.

Regards



Jum, 29 Jul

Editorial Office ljab 11.37

kepada saya

Dear author

We have only one way for receive payments through only Bank transfer due to FBR
income Tax problem, so please send your charges through our said Bank transfer:

To Friends Science Publishers through International Bank Account Number
(IBAN) PK47THABB0001427901881203 (Swift Code: HABBPKKA) Habib Bank of
Pakistan, University of Agriculture Branch, Faisalabad, Pakistan. Please Send a
copy of the transaction document indicating complete name and address of sender and
reference number of the accepted paper for which publication charges have been paid

at zafaruaf1@gmail.com and editorijab@yahoo.com

Account title: Friends Science Publishers
Account NO: (IBAN) PK47THABB0001427901881203
Swift Code: HABBPKKA

Address: Habib Bank of Pakistan, Bankers Street, Near Power House
Department, University of Agriculture Faisalabad, Pakistan

IJAB Office Address: House No 519, Umar Block, Riazul Jannah, Masjid Ismail
Road, Faisalabad, Pakistan


mailto:zafaruaf1@gmail.com
mailto:editorijab@yahoo.com

Friends Science Publishers

Regards,

Office Assistant/Business Manager

Editorial Office

International Journal of Agriculture and Biology
Friends Science Publishers

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com>

Sab, 30 Jul
12.24

kepada Editorial

Dear

I appreciate the confirmation. We will immediately make payment via bank transfer
Regards

IK Widnyana

Sen, 1 Agu

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com> 13.31

kepada Editorial

Dear

We submit proof of transfer in accordance with the editorial office instructions for our
article number M.S. NO: IJAB-22-0155

M.S. Title: Potential Inhibitory Effects of Rhizopus oligosporus on the Growth of
Aspergillus flavus FNCC6109 in Corn Seeds

Thank you for your attention

Regards


http://www.fspublishers.org/

IK Widnyana

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com>

Rab, 3 Agu
21.01

kepada Editorial

Dear
Thanks for your information
Regard’s

IK Widnyana

Fwd: doi 15.1959 IJAB-22-0155 Galley Proof for Your Handling
Kotak Masuk

Sel, 16 Agu 13.47 (12 hari

Dr. Arshad Javaid yang lalu)

kepada saya

Terjemahkan pesan

Dear Author

I am forwarding you galley proof of your paper.

1- Please check any mistakes and mention the corrections
in correction grid.

2- Get the copyright signed by all authors.



3- Return correction grid and signed copyright in 3 days.

Regards

Dr. Arshad Javaid

Professor

Department of Plant Pathology

Faculty of Agricultural Sciences

University of the Punjab, Quaid-i-Azam Campus
Lahore, Pakistan

Phone: +92-42-99231846

Cell: +92-300-4580679

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Editorial Office ljab <editorijab@yahoo.com>

Date: Tue, 16 Aug 2022 at 09:17

Subject: doi 15.1959 IJAB-22-0155 Galley Proof for Your Handling
To: Arshad Javed <arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk>

Dear Sir

Attached is the galley proof of author's paper for correction if any. The GP has
been prepared after editing by our Editors. This is perhaps the final time author's
paper is with you before publication. So please send it to author.

Author read it very carefully, indicate LEGITIMATE corrections using the
CORRECTION GRID which considered Last time and after this No any
corrections considered suggested by author, So read it care fully and make Final
corrections in CORRECTION GRID along withsigned copyright
form from all authors and send with in 3 days. Also please give full attention to
highlights and BOLD fonts if any. Any delay from author's side will delay the
publication of your paper.

Please note corrections (if any) will be made in the uncorrected proofs indicated
by author(s) at this stage. No changes will be made after the proofs are corrected
and final published PDF is emailed to author(s)

You are further requested to send a scan of the original signed Transfer of Copyright (TOC) form
along with the corrections.
with regards


mailto:editorijab@yahoo.com
mailto:arshad.iags@pu.edu.pk

Muhammad Farooq

Editor-in-Chief

International Journal of Agriculture and Biology
Friends Science Publishers

Regards,

Office Assistant/Business Manager

Editorial Office

International Journal of Agriculture and Biology
Friends Science Publishers

3 Lampiran

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com>

kepada Arshad

Dear
Noted with thanks.

Reagrds

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com>

kepada Arshad

Sel, 16 Agu 20.37 (12 hari
yang lalu)

Rab, 17 Agu 11.52 (11 hari

yang lalu)


http://www.fspublishers.org/

Dear Dr. Arshad Javaid

We attach the Correction grid and copyright that has been signed by all authors. Thank
you for your attention and assistance.

Regards

IK Widnyana

2 Lampiran

Rab, 17 Agu 13.26 (11 hari

Dr. Arshad Javaid yang lalu)

kepada saya

Terjemahkan pesan

OK Thanks

Dr. Arshad Javaid

Professor

Department of Plant Pathology

Faculty of Agricultural Sciences

University of the Punjab, Quaid-i-Azam Campus
Lahore, Pakistan

Phone: +92-42-99231846

Cell: +92-300-4580679

[IJAB]: Final Published PDF; IJAB-22-0155
Kotak Masuk



25 Agu 2022 17.22 (3 hari
Dr. Abdul Wahid <drawahid2001@yahoo.com> yang lalu)

kepada saya

Dear Contributor,
Attached is the final published PDF of your paper. The paper will be made available online shortly.

We thank you for choosing IJAB as a medium for publishing your high-quality work. At the same time
IJAB management hopes that you will keep on citing this paper in your papers submitted to journals
other than IJAB

Best regards

Editor1 (IJAB)

Abdul Wahid, PhD

Professor of Botany

University of Agriculture, Faisalabad 38040, Pakistan

Phone: Office 92 41 9200161 ext 3306; Cell 92 300 7290264

Email: drawahid@uaf.edu.pk; drawahid2001@yahoo.com
http://www.uaf.edu.pk/faculties/sciences/depts/botany/bt_staff.html

Editor, Int J Agric Biol (www.fspublishers.orq)

Thomson Reuters ResearcherlD; Google Citations
Area lampiran

26 Agu 2022 19.23 (2 hari

| Ketut widnyana <widnyanaketut@gmail.com> yang lalu)

kepada Abdul


mailto:drawahid@uaf.edu.pk
mailto:drawahid2001@yahoo.com
http://www.uaf.edu.pk/faculties/sciences/depts/botany/bt_staff.html
http://www.fspublishers.org/

Dear

Thanks for the good news

Regards

IK Widnyana

Sent from my iPhone

On 25 Aug 2022, at 17.22, Dr. Abdul Wahid <drawahid2001@yahoo.com> wrote:


mailto:drawahid2001@yahoo.com

